

BID SHEET
Rock (Sand and Gravel)

BIDDER'S COMPANY NAME

Zack Burkett Co.

ADDRESS

P. O. Box 40

Graham, Texas 76450

PHONE

940-549-0436

LOCATIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS:

BID PRICE PER TON:

Precinct No. 1--Byers, Texas

1½" Crusher run base

\$5.75

1" Crusher run base

\$6.00

Pit run base

No Bid

Screening 3/8" and down

\$8.50 - Driveway Material

¾" down base

No Bid

Backfill

No Bid

Precinct No. 2--Dean, Texas

1½" Crusher run base

\$5.75

1" Crusher run base

\$6.00

Pit run base

No Bid

Screening 3/8" and down

\$8.50 - Driveway Material

¾" down base

No Bid

Backfill

No Bid

Precinct No. 3--Midway, Texas

2" - 6" Oversize	\$8.50
1½" - 3" Small Oversize	\$8.50
Asphalt 8" to 12" Rip Raf	\$10.50
Screening	\$8.50 - Driveway Material
1½" Crusher Run base	\$5.75
1" Crusher Run base	\$6.00
Commercial Base	\$5.75

Precinct No. 4--Bellevue, Texas

1 ½" - 3" Small oversize	\$8.50
1½" Crusher run base	\$5.75
1" Crusher run base	\$6.00
Pit run base	No Bid
Screenings 3/8" and down	\$8.50
3/4" down base	No Bid



Authorized Signature